
Requisition:
Requestor:

Date:
Bid No.

Bid Subject
Bid Open Date
Bid Open Time

Bid Open By
FOB Point: Minority?

Award?
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

1
Ellipse Soft w/Stylus-laser 

metal pen Quantity 100 500 1,000 2,500 5000

Price 1.55$                      1.15$                          1.05$                         0.95$                     0.78$                            

Freight
Shipping 23.05$                    38.52$                        77.04$                      192.60$                385.20$                        

Setup Fee 50.00$                    50.00$                        50.00$                      50.00$                   50.00$                          

Cost
No. # Description 228.05$                  663.52$                     1,177.04$                2,617.60$             4,355.20$                    

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
7 Clear Tote Quantity 50 300 500 1000 2000

Price 5.12$                      4.40$                          4.40$                         4.33$                     4.326
Freight

Shipping 37.28$                    189.24$                     328.10$                    489.26$                489.26

Setup Fee 33.00$                    33.00$                        33.00$                      33.00$                   33.00$                          
Cost 326.08$                  1,542.54$                  2,561.60$                4,848.26$             9,174.26$                    

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
8 Hand Sanitizer sprayer Quantity 50 200 400 500 1000

Price 1.22$                          1.16$                         1.09$                     1.05$                            
Freight

Shipping 27.86$                        41.51$                      48.81$                   75.10$                          

Setup Fee 50.00$                        50.00$                      50.00$                   50.00$                          
Cost No bid 321.86$                     555.51$                    643.81$                1,175.10$                    

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

9

Colored frosted die-
cut convention bag 

18” x 15” Quantity 50 200 400 500 1000
Price No bid 0.78$                          0.70$                         0.70$                     0.68$                            

Freight
Shipping 77.76$                        77.76$                      77.76$                   155.52$                        

Setup Fee 75.00$                        75.00$                      75.00$                   75.00$                          
Cost #VALUE! 308.76$                     432.76$                    502.76$                910.52$                        

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
12 Quantity 1 2 3 4 5

Price 685.00$                  640.50$                     640.50$                    640.50$                640.50$                        
Freight

Shipping 95.00$                    185.00$                     260.00$                    310.00$                395.00$                        
Setup Fee

Cost 780.00$                  1,466.00$                  2,181.50$                2,872.00$             3,597.50$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

14
Retractable Badge Holder 

Clip Quantity 100 500 1000 2500 5000
Price 1.71$                          1.57$                         1.46$                     0.94$                            

Freight
Shipping 26.04$                        41.15$                      108.34$                205.75$                        

Setup Fee 35.00$                        35.00$                      35.00$                   35.00$                          
Cost -$                        915.04$                     1,644.15$                3,783.34$             4,930.75$                    

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

15 Clear Drawstring Backpack Quantity 50 200 300 400 500
Price 3.18$                      2.01$                          1.95$                         1.98                       1.93$                            

Freight
Shipping 46.00$                    46.00$                        46.00$                      46.00$                   46.00$                          

Setup Fee 36.00$                    36.00$                        36.00$                      36.00$                   36.00$                          

Cost 241.00$                  484.00$                     667.00$                    874.00$                1,047.00$                    

Tent
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No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
16 Silicone Bracelet Quantity 50 500 700 1000 2000

Price 0.58$                          0.58$                         0.49$                     0.49
Freight

Shipping 59.00$                        73.00$                      94.00$                   116.00$                        
Setup Fee 28.00$                        28.00$                      28.00$                   28.00$                          

Cost No bid 377.00$                     507.00$                    612.00$                1,124.00$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

17 Clear Drawstring Backpack Quantity 50 100 300 500 1000
Price 4.36$                      4.25$                          4.10$                        4.01$                     3.88$                            

Freight
Shipping 42.55$                    42.55$                        127.65$                    212.75$                425.50$                        

Setup Fee 56.25$                    56.25$                        56.25$                      56.25$                   56.25$                          

Cost 316.80$                  523.80$                     1,413.90$                2,274.00$             4,361.75$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

19 Step & Repeat Banner 8'x8'
Quantity 1 2 3 4 5

Price 195.00$                  180.00$                     180.00$                    180.00$                180.00$                        
Freight

Shipping 45.00$                    62.00$                        92.00$                      112.00$                152.00$                        
Setup Fee

Cost 240.00$                  422.00$                     632.00$                    832.00$                1,052.00$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

20 Portable Charger Quantity 50 100 200 300 500
Price 7.02$                          7.02$                         6.89$                     6.74$                            

Freight
Shipping 47.03$                        94.06$                      141.09$                235.15$                        

Setup Fee 56.00$                        56.00$                      56.00$                   56.00$                          
Cost No bid 805.03$                     1,554.06$                2,264.09$             3,661.15$                    

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
21 Quantity 25 50 100 150 250

Price 9.95$                          5.45$                         3.45$                            
Freight

Shipping 37.00$                        52.00$                      72.00$                          
Setup Fee

Cost -$                        497.50$                     545.00$                    -$                       934.50$                        
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

22 Squeezable Stress Balls Quantity 25 50 100 150 200
Price 1.83$                          0.92$                         0.92$                     0.92$                            

Freight
Shipping 25.00$                        44.00$                      58.00$                   61.00$                          

Setup Fee 32.00$                        32.00$                      32.00$                   32.00$                          

Cost -$                        148.50$                     168.00$                    228.00$                277.00$                        
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

25 White Vinyl Decal Quantity 250 500 1000 1500 2000
Price 2.65$                      1.05$                          0.70$                         0.6 0.45

Freight
Shipping 38.00$                    52.00$                        65.00$                      80 90

Setup Fee
Cost 700.50$                  577.00$                     765.00$                    980.00$                990.00$                        

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
26 Megaphone Quantity 100 250 500 1000 2500

Price 1.59$                      1.37$                          1.14$                         1.08$                     0.99$                            
Freight

Shipping 25.26$                    36.64$                        73.28$                      146.56$                366.40$                        
Setup Fee 56.25$                    56.25$                        56.25$                      56.25$                   56.25$                          

Cost 240.51$                  435.39$                     699.53$                    1,282.81$             2,897.65$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

29 4" Mini Volleyball Quantity 50 100 200 300 500 700
Price 2.89$                          2.89$                         2.61$                     2.61$                            2.61$                 

Freight
Shipping 46.00$                        92.00$                      138.00$                230.00$                        322.00$            

Setup Fee 45.00$                        45.00$                      45.00$                   45.00$                          45.00$               
Cost NO BID 380.00$                     715.00$                    966.00$                1,580.00$                    2,194.00$         

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
30 Bamboo Hand Fans Quantity 300 500 1000 2000 3000

Price 6.80$                      4.61$                          4.19$                         3.91$                     3.76$                            
Freight

Shipping 130.00$                  160.00$                     295.00$                    590.00$                880.00$                        

Setup Fee 105.00$                  105.00$                     105.00$                    105.00$                105.00$                        

Cost 2,273.80$              2,571.00$                  4,592.00$                8,519.00$             12,259.00$                  
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

31 Spiral Notebook w/Pen Quantity 100 250 500 1000 2500

Two Pocket Folders



Price 4.13$                      4.13$                          3.79$                         3.65$                     3.64$                            
Freight 282.44$                    342.93$                470.68$                        

Shipping 126.72$                  316.80$                     
Setup Fee 40.00$                    40.00$                        40.00$                      40.00$                   40.00$                          

Cost 579.72$                  1,389.30$                  2,219.44$                4,036.93$             9,610.68$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
33 Outdoor Booney Hat Quantity 100 300 500 2000

Price 15.15$                    14.50$                        14.50$                      14.35$                   
Freight

Shipping
Setup Fee

Cost 1,515.00$              4,350.00$                  7,250.00$                28,700.00$           
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
36 Clear Shoe Bags Quantity 1500 4500 9000 18000

Price 0.83$                      0.61$                          0.57$                         0.30$                     
Freight

Shipping 159.70$                  416.98$                     785.32$                    1,597.32$             
Setup Fee 50.00$                    50.00$                        50.00$                      50.00$                   

Cost 1,454.70$              3,211.98$                  5,965.32$                7,047.32$             
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
39 Quantity 100 250 500 1000

Price 9.13$                      8.43$                          7.60$                         7.33$                     
Freight

Shipping 159.00$                  358.00$                     720.00$                    1,431.00$             
Setup Fee 40.00$                    40.00$                        40.00$                      40.00$                   

Cost 1,112.00$              2,505.50$                  4,560.00$                8,801.00$             
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
40 Quantity 72 144 288 576 1008

Price 6.93$                      6.93$                          6.93$                         6.93$                     6.65$                            
Freight

Shipping 62.72$                    62.72$                        62.72$                      62.72$                   62.72$                          
Setup Fee

Cost 561.68$                  1,060.64$                  2,058.56$                4,054.40$             6,765.92$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
47 Quantity 500 1000 3000 5000

Price 3.08$                      2.98$                          2.88$                         2.80$                     
Freight

Shipping 91.62$                    183.24$                     484.75$                    732.96$                
Setup Fee 60.00$                    60.00$                        60.00$                      60.00$                   

Cost 1,691.62$              3,225.24$                  9,196.75$                14,792.96$           
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
48 Quantity 50 100 300 500

Price 4.67$                      4.34$                          4.10$                         3.87$                     
Freight

Shipping 22.00$                    22.00$                        23.00$                      31.00$                   
Setup Fee

Cost 255.50$                  456.00$                     1,253.00$                1,966.00$             
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
49 Quantity 25 350 700 1025 1350

Price 2.49$                      2.10$                          2.00$                         1.95$                     1.95$                            
Freight

Shipping 19.50$                    25.19$                        29.52$                      34.85$                   42.96$                          
Setup Fee 48.00$                    48.00$                        48.00$                      48.00$                   48.00$                          

Cost 129.75$                  808.19$                     1,477.52$                2,081.60$             2,723.46$                    
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

5 Tablecloth Quantity 1 2 3 4 5
Price 136.50$                  125.00$                     125.00$                    125.00$                125

Freight
Shipping 35.00$                    48.00$                        57.00$                      64.00$                   74

Setup Fee

Cost 171.50$                  298.00$                     432.00$                    564.00$                699.00$                        
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
50 Quantity 100 200 500 1000 5000

Price 1.86$                      1.86$                          1.70$                         1.62$                     1.54$                            
Freight

Shipping 19.00$                    27.00$                        65.00$                      130.00$                602.00$                        
Setup Fee 88.00$                    88.00$                        88.00$                      88.00$                   88.00$                          

Cost 293.00$                  487.00$                     1,003.00$                1,838.00$             8,390.00$                    

Canvas Tote Bag

Lion Stree Reliever

3-n-1 Charging Cables

Pop Sockets

Leather Notebook

Bistro Coffe Mugs 
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