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No. # 8 Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

8
Antibacterial hand 
sanitizer sprayer 50 200 400 500 1000

no bid 0.90$                   0.90$           0.86$                0.86$              

26.00$                 38.00$         43.00$              70.00$            
40.00$                 40.00$         40.00$              40.00$            

#VALUE! 246.00$               438.00$       513.00$            970.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

11 Football 50 200 400 500 1000
No bid 1.99$                   1.92$           1.80                   1.71$              

98.00$                 195.00$       243.00              484.00$          

34.00$                 34.00$         34.00$              34.00$            
No bid 530.00$               997.00$       1,177.00$         2,228.00$       

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
12 Tent 1 2 3 4 5

445.00$                                 445.00$               415.00$       405.00              399.00$          

33.00                                      33.00                   33.00           33.00                33.00              
478.00$                                 923.00$               1,278.00$    1,653.00$         2,028.00$       

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

15 Drawstring Sport Pack #REF! 200 300 400 500
no bid 2.30$                   2.05$           2.05$                1.97$              

30.00$                 30.00$         30.00$              30.00$            

490.00$               645.00$       850.00$            1,015.00$       
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

14 Round Button 2-1/4" 50 500 700 1000 2000
2.00$                                      0.51$                   0.51$           0.41$                0.39$              

16.00$                                   22.00$                 25.00$         34.00$              64.00$            

116.00$                                 277.00$               382.00$       444.00$            844.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

20 50 100 200 300 500
8.06$                                      7.64$                   7.44$           6.79$                6.29$              

403.00$                                 764.00$               1,488.00$    2,037.00$         3,145.00$       
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

UI listed 2200 Mah 
Charge-it-up Portable 
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21 25 50 100 150 200
no bid no bid 4.40$           4.03$                3.62$              

#VALUE! #VALUE! 440.00$       604.50$            724.00$          
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

23
Handheld retractable 

banner 300 500 1000 2500 5000
1.39$                                      1.08$                   0.85$           0.76$                0.72$              

80.00$                                   80.00$                 80.00$         80.00$              80.00$            

497.00$                                 620.00$               930.00$       1,980.00$         3,680.00$       
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

25 250 500 1000 1500 2000
1.06$                                      0.91$                   0.79$           0.71$                0.67$              

39.00$                                   39.00$                 49.00$         49.00$              49.00$            

304.00$                                 494.00$               839.00$       1,114.00$         1,389.00$       
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

26 Megaphone 100 50 500 1000 2500 5000
1.48$                                      1.30$                   1.04$           1.02$                0.92$              0.80$            

27.00$                                   39.00$                 75.00$         148.00$            367.00$          731.00$        
30.00$                                   30.00$                 30.00$         30.00$              30.00$            30.00$          

205.00$                                 134.00$               625.00$       1,198.00$         2,697.00$       4,761.00$     
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

27
1" Lanyard with 

Lobster clip 100 250 500 1000 2500 5000
1.08$                                      0.91$                   0.80$           0.71$                0.67$              0.59$            

40.00$                                   40.00$                 40.00$         40.00$              40.00$            40.00$          
148.00$                                 267.50$               440.00$       750.00$            1,715.00$       2,990.00$     

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

29

3-n-1 Braided Charging 
Buddy 100 250 500 1000 29 5000

2.85$                                      2.24$                   2.12$           1.85$                1.60$              1.30$            

815.00$        
37.00$                                   37.00$                 37.00$         37.00$              37.00$            43.00$          

322.00$                                 597.00$               1,097.00$    1,887.00$         83.40$            7,358.00$     
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

31 Tape Measure 100 250 500 1000 2500 5000
1.45$                                      1.09$                   0.99$           0.59$                0.56$              0.50$            

35.00$                                   35.00$                 35.00$         35.00$              35.00$            35.00$          

180.00$                                 307.50$               530.00$       625.00$            1,435.00$       2,535.00$     
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

33 Engineer Ruler 100 250 500 1000
3.85$                                      3.85$                   3.50$           3.26$                

30.00$                                   30.00$                 30.00$         30.00$              
415.00$                                 992.50$               1,780.00$    3,290.00$         -$                

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

Two pocket Folders

White Vinyl Decal 
W/custom Die cut 



34

House Shaped tool kit 
w/4 steel bits & 

Keychain 100 250 500 1000 2500 5000
1.65$                                      1.65$                   1.60$           1.55$                1.40$              1.30$            

27.00$                                   54.00$                 95.00$         186.00$            400.00$          815.00$        
43.00$                                   43.00$                 43.00$         43.00$              43.00$            43.00$          

235.00$                                 509.50$               938.00$       1,779.00$         3,943.00$       7,358.00$     
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

35

Spectrum Hard Cover 
Journal

100 250 500 1000
2.85$                                      2.85$                   2.70$           2.62$                

44.00$                                   107.00$               212.00$       275.00$            
50.00$                                   50.00$                 50.00$         50.00$              

379.00$                                 869.50$               1,612.00$    2,945.00$         -$                
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

38

Mouse Pad 
w/Antimicrobial 

Additive 100 250 500 1000 5000
2.58$                                      2.37$                   1.92$           1.75$                1.40$              

30.00$                                   30.00$                 30.00$         30.00$              30.00$            
288.00$                                 622.50$               990.00$       1,780.00$         7,030.00$       

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

39
Clam cellphone holder

100 250 500 1000
1.89$                                      1.89$                   1.79$           1.69$                

27.00$                                   52.00$                 103.00$       179.00$            
43.00$                                   43.00$                 43.00$         43.00$              

259.00$                                 567.50$               1,041.00$    1,912.00$         -$                
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