
Requisition:
Requestor:

Date:
Bid No.

Bid Subject
Bid Open Date
Bid Open Time

Bid Open By
FOB Point: Minority?

Award?
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

4
Click Action Plastic 

Ball point pen Quantity 50 100 300 500 1000
Price No bid 1.15$                 0.65$              0.54$            0.49$                

Freight
Shipping 35.00$              40.00$            40.00$          75.00$              

Setup Fee -$              65.00$              65.00$            65.00$          65.00$              
Cost No bid 215.00$            300.00$          375.00$       630.00$           

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

15

Colored frosted 
die-cut 

convention bag 
18” x 15” Quantity 50 200 400 500 1000

Price No bid 0.92$                 0.61$              0.55$            0.53$                
Freight

Shipping  40.00$              50.00$            65.00$          105.00$           

Setup Fee 60.00$              60.00$            60.00$          60.00$              

Cost No bid 284.00$            354.00$          400.00$       695.00$           
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

17
Step and Repeat 

Banner 8’ x 8’ Quantity 1 2 3 4 5
Price 172.00$        165.00$            165.00$          165.00$       165.00$           

Freight

Shipping 35.00$          40.00$              45.00$            55.00$          60.00$              

Setup Fee

Cost 207.00$        370.00$            540.00$          715.00$       885.00$           
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

19

Messenger Bag 
with matching 
striped handle Quantity 25 50 100 150 200

Price 21.42$          14.09$              14.09$            12.25$          12.25$              
Freight

Friday, September 15, 2023 Address: 3297 Jordan Crossing
10:00 A.M. CST Alma, AR 72921

UAPB Warehouse 1200 N. Uni. Drive NO
Gym/Annex Building Pine Bluff, Arkansas 71601

UAPB P178 Email: cweaver@gomarkit.net
Promotional Items Fax: 479-234-2613

CAMPUS BID Contact: Carrie Weaver
Tuesday, August 22, 2023 Phone: 870-534-0233

University of Arkansas Go Markit LLC
Bid Tabulation Sheet

(2) Bidder Name: Go Markit LLC

mailto:cweaver@gomarkit.net
mailto:cweaver@gomarkit.net


Shipping 40.00$          90.00$              135.00$          200.00$       225.00$           
Setup Fee 50.00$          50.00$              50.00$            50.00$          50.00$              

Cost 625.50$        844.50$            1,594.00$      2,087.50$    2,725.00$        
No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity

6 Custom T-Shirts Quantity 100 200 400 500 600
7.35$            6.69$                 5.89$              5.84$            5.79$                

2XL
2.00$            2.00$                 2.00$              2.00$            2.00$                

Art Fee
Shipping -$              -$                   -$                -$              -$                  

Setup Fee
Cost 737.00$        1,340.00$        2,358.00$      2,922.00$    3,476.00$        

No. # Description Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity Quantity
24 Megaphone 100 250 500 1000 2500 5000

1.51$                              1.31$            1.08$                 1.03$              0.95$            0.85$                

20.00$                            35.00$          70.00$              140.00$          280.00$       425.00$           

60.00$                            60.00$          60.00$              60.00$            60.00$          60.00$              

231.00$                         422.50$        670.00$            1,230.00$      2,715.00$    4,735.00$        

T Shirts-Small- PRICE
T Shirts-Med-PRICE

T Shirts-Lg-XXL-PRICE
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